
① Click "Continue to application"

②
Register your email address to
complete the registration
procedures.

③

When you receive an email
confirming that the registration
procedures have been completed,
click on the URL in the body of the
email to Apply for Service.

④

In the collge/graduate school
selection, please be sure to select
the APU college/graduate school
on the left.
*It is located at the bottom of the
pull-down menu.

⑤

Once you receive an email saying
that your application has been
accepted, please wait until you are
notified of the results.
*Applications submitted outside
office hours will be processed the
following day or later.

⑥

When you receive an e-mail
approving your application for use,
log in using the user ID (e-mail
address registered at the time of
application) and password (set at
the time of application) written in
the email.

https://crt.ritsumei.ac.jp/Student/en-US/SystemApplicationMailAddressRegistration
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